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ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT
P. O. Box 170

Port Allen, Louisiana 70767-0170

Phone (225) 387-2249

Fax    (225) 387-4742







June 7, 2023





A public hearing of the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District was held in the office of the Board in Port Allen, Louisiana at 4:00 pm, Wednesday, 
June 7, 2023. President John Grezaffi called the public hearing to order and declared a quorum present. The following members were present:

COMMISSIONER


PARISH

Bill Flynn



West Baton Rouge

Kenneth Gordon


West Baton Rouge
John Grezaffi


Pointe Coupee
Mark Guillory


St. Landry

Daniel Hebert


Iberville

Karen Jewell



Iberville
Earl Matherne


Assumption

Sean McGee



Iberia
Jody Meche



St. Martin

Tommy Thibodeaux

St. Martin

Absent: 

Spencer Harvey


Ascension

Nickie Rockforte


Pointe Coupee
Also Present:

INDIVIDUAL


REPRESENTING

Travis Johnson


CPRA

David Mougeot


Mougeot Architecture

Darby Clarke


Mougeot Architecture

John Mouton


Westside Journal

William Tyson


Executive Director
Nicholas Rockforte


Levee Board Attorney

Janice Jarreau


Administrative Program Manager

Kristy Jewell


Human Resource Analyst
Crissi Canezaro


Administrative Program Specialist A

                                                                    * * * * 
Secretary Janice Jarreau read the following notice: 
A public hearing will be held as follows: Wednesday, June 7, 2023, at 4:00 pm at the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District Board Room, 525 Court Street, Port Allen, LA 70767. 
To consider levying additional or increased millage rates without further voter approval or adopting the adjusted millage rate after reassessment and rolling forward to a rate not to exceed the prior year's maximum. The estimated amount of tax revenues to be collected in the next tax year from the increased millage is $9,244,318.82 and the amount of increase in taxes attributable to the millage increase is $109,834.86. 
Commissioner Mark Guillory moved, seconded by Commissioner Kenneth Gordon, and unanimously carried to close the public hearing.

                                                                     * * * *
Mr. William Tyson read the public meeting notice stating the meeting will be held as follows:  Wednesday, June 7, 2023, at 4:15 pm or immediately following the public hearing at the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District Board Room, 525 Court Street, Port Allen, LA 70767.

Secretary Janice Jarreau called the roll.
COMMISSIONER


PARISH

Bill Flynn



West Baton Rouge

Kenneth Gordon


West Baton Rouge

John Grezaffi


Pointe Coupee

Mark Guillory


St. Landry

Daniel Hebert


Iberville

Karen Jewell



Iberville

Earl Matherne


Assumption

Sean McGee



Iberia
Jody Meche



St. Martin

Tommy Thibodeaux

St. Martin

Absent: 


Spencer Harvey


Ascension

Nickie Rockforte


Pointe Coupee

Also Present:

INDIVIDUAL


REPRESENTING


Travis Johnson


CPRA

David Mougeot


Mougeot Architecture

Darby Clarke


Mougeot Architecture

John Mouton


Westside Journal

William Tyson


Executive Director

Janice Jarreau


Administrative Program Manager

Kristy Jewell


Human Resource Analyst

Crissi Canezaro


Administrative Program Specialist A

                                                                    * * * * 
President John Grezaffi called the meeting to order and declared a quorum present.  
President John Grezaffi asked for public comments. Hearing none, he proceeded with the meeting agenda. 

                                                                     * * * *
After review, Commissioner Sean McGee moved, seconded by Commissioner Mark Guillory, and unanimously carried to approve the minutes of the May 3, 2023, meeting as presented and to publish the minutes in the official journal.
                                                                     * * * *
    RESOLUTION NO. 1


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District of the Parishes of Ascension, Assumption, Iberia, Iberville, Pointe Coupee, St. Landry, St. Martin and West Baton Rouge, Louisiana, in a public meeting held on June 7, 2023, which meeting was conducted in accordance with the Open Meetings Law and the additional requirements of Article VII, Section 23(C) of the Louisiana Constitution and R.S. 47:1705(B), that the following adjusted millage rate be and they are hereby levied upon the dollar of the assessed valuation of all property subject to ad valorem taxation within said Parishes for the year 2023, for the purpose of raising revenue:








MILLAGE




Constitutional


4.01 mills

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Assessor of the Parishes of Ascension, Assumption, Iberia, Iberville, Pointe Coupee, St. Landry, St. Martin and West Baton Rouge, shall extend upon the assessment roll for the year 2023 the taxes herein levied, and the tax collector of said Parishes shall collect and remit the same to said taxing authority in accordance with law. 


The foregoing resolution was read in full, the roll was called on the adoption thereof, and the resolution was adopted by the following votes:


YEAS:
10




NAYS:
0


ABSTAINED:
0


ABSENT:  3

CERTIFICATE


I hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and exact copy of the resolution adopted at the meeting held on June 7, 2023, at which meeting a quorum was present and voting.


Port Allen, Louisiana, this 7th day of June, 2023.

________________________________________

John Grezaffi, President

    The foregoing resolution was read in full; the roll was called on the adoption thereof, and the resolution was adopted by the following votes:


YEAS:  Commissioners Flynn, Gordon, Grezaffi, Guillory, Hebert, Jewell, Matherne, McGee, Meche, and Thibodeaux


NAYS:  None


ABSTAINED:  None


ABSENT:  Commissioners Harvey and Rockforte

                                                                     * * * *
    RESOLUTION NO. 2


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District of the Parishes of Ascension, Assumption, Iberia, Iberville, Pointe Coupee, St. Landry, St. Martin and West Baton Rouge, Louisiana, in a public meeting held on June 7, 2023, which meeting was conducted in accordance with the Open Meetings Law and the additional requirements of Article VII, Section 23(C) of the Louisiana Constitution and R.S. 47:1705(B), that the taxing district voted to increase the millage rate(s), but not in excess of the prior year’s maximum rate(s), on all taxable property shown on the official assessment roll for the year 2023, and when collected, the revenues from said taxes shall be used only for the specific purposes for which said taxes have been levied. Said millage rate(s) are: 








Adjusted Rate


2023 Levy


Constitutional




4.01 mills


4.04 mills


BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Assessor of the Parishes of Ascension, Assumption, Iberia, Iberville, Pointe Coupee, St. Landry, St. Martin and West Baton Rouge, shall extend upon the assessment roll for the year 2023 the taxes herein levied, and the tax collector of said Parishes shall collect and remit the same to said taxing authority in accordance with law. 

The foregoing resolution was read in full, the roll was called on the adoption thereof, and the resolution was adopted by no less than two-thirds of the total membership of the taxing authority voting in favor as required by Article VII, Section 23(C) of the Louisiana Constitution and R.S. 47:1705(B). The votes were:


YEAS:
10


NAYS:
0


ABSTAINED:
0


ABSENT:  3

CERTIFICATE


I hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and exact copy of the resolution adopted at the meeting held on June 7, 2023, at which meeting at least two-thirds of the total membership was present and voting.


Port Allen, Louisiana, this 7th day of June, 2023.

________________________________________






John Grezaffi, President
    The foregoing resolution was read in full; the roll was called on the adoption thereof, and the resolution was adopted by the following votes:


YEAS:  Commissioners Flynn, Gordon, Grezaffi, Guillory, Hebert, Jewell, Matherne, McGee, Meche, and Thibodeaux


NAYS:  None


ABSTAINED:  None


ABSENT:  Commissioners Harvey and Rockforte

                                                                     * * * *
ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS

OFFICIAL JOURNAL


Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District, at 525 Court Street, Port Allen, Louisiana, up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June 7, 2023, for printing and publication of minutes of meetings of the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District and all other legal advertisements required by law for a period of one (1) year.  


All bids will be publicly opened and read at 4:00 p.m. of the same day, and any bid received subsequent to 2:00 p.m. will be returned unopened.


The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to waive informalities.


Bid to be submitted in sealed envelope marked “BID - OFFICIAL JOURNAL.”

Janice G. Jarreau




 John Grezaffi

Secretary





 President

3t

Pointe Coupee Banner, Plaquemine Post South and West Side Journal

May 1, 15, and 29, 2023.

The following bids were duly opened and read:

     ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT

TABULATION OF BIDS

June 7, 2023

OFFICIAL JOURNAL

	DESCRIPTION
OFFICIAL JOURNAL


	Pointe Coupee 

Banner
	Westside

Journal
	Plaquemine Post South 

Gannett Co.

	For printing and publication of minutes of the ABLD and all other legal advertisements required by law for a period of one (1) year.


	Amount per square inch

$           5.00_____
	Amount per square inch

$ 6.00 per sq inch

$7.00 per column inch        
	Amount per square inch

$ 6.00 per sq inch



The lowest bid was submitted by Pointe Coupee Banner at $5.00 per square inch.  However, John Mouton of Westside Journal said their bid was based on what was allowed by state law.  It was noted by Levee Board Attorney Nicholas Rockforte that this was the legal maximum approved rate by state law, and we are required to take the lowest responsive bid. After discussion, Commissioner Jody Meche moved, seconded by Commissioner Tommy Thibodeaux, and unanimously carried to approve the lowest bid from Pointe Coupee Banner, subject to review by our legal counsel.

                                                                     * * * * 

NOTICE

Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners, Atchafalaya Basin 

Levee District, in its Office in Port Allen, Louisiana, up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June 7, 2023 

and can also be submitted online at www.centralauctionhouse.com for:

(1)

Furnishing Gasoline and Diesel Fuel delivered at designated locations

within the District in quantities as requested for twelve calendar months

beginning July 1, 2023 and ending June 30, 2024.

(2)

Furnishing Crushed Limestone delivered at designated locations within the District in quantities as requested for twelve calendar months beginning July 1, 2023 and ending June 30, 2024.

All bids will be publicly opened and read at 4:00 p.m. of the same day, and any bid

received after 2:00 p.m. will be returned unopened.

The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to waive informalities.

Bid to be submitted in sealed envelope marked





 “BID – FUEL” or “BID - AGGREGATES.”
Specifications, proposal forms, etc., are available at the Atchafalaya Basin Levee 

District Office, (525 Court Street) P. O. Box 170, Port Allen, Louisiana 70767, telephone

number (225) 387-2249.

Janice G. Jarreau





John Grezaffi

Secretary






            President

3t

Daily Journal of Commerce, The Advocate, Plaquemine Post South, and Pointe Coupee Banner

May 1, 15, and 29, 2023

The following bids were duly opened and read:

      SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT

TABULATION OF BIDS

Wednesday, June 1, 2023

DESCRIPTION
	Name of Bidder
	Acadian
Shell
	Slats

Lucas
	Bear 
Industries 
	RJ

Thibodeaux

	
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton

	ITEM #1

Crushed 

Limestone (#57)
	$50.30
	No bid
	$54.75
	$54.00

	ITEM #2

Crushed Limestone(#610)
	$49.30
	No bid
	$53.75
	$53.00

	ITEM #3

Crushed Limestone(#57)
	No bid
	$41.00
	No bid
	No bid

	ITEM #4

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No bid
	No bid
	$39.75
	No bid

	ITEM #5

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	$58.90
	No bid
	No bid
	$50.00

	ITEM #6

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	$69.30
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	ITEM #7

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No bid
	$51.00
	No bid
	$54.00

	ITEM #8

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	$53.00

	ITEM #9

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	$52.50

	ITEM #10

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	$55.00

	ITEM #11

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	$68.50
	$56.50
	No bid
	$52.50

	ITEM # 12

Crushed 

Limestone (#57)
	$63.00
	No bid
	No bid
	$52.50

	ITEM #13

Crushed 

Limestone (#610)
	No bid
	$40.00
	No bid
	No bid

	ITEM #14

Crushed 

Limestone (#610)
	No bid
	No bid
	$38.75
	No bid


Commissioner Tommy Thibodeaux moved, seconded by Commissioner Sean McGee, and unanimously carried to take the bids under advisement.

                                                                     * * * * 
The following bids were duly opened and read:

ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT

TABULATION OF BIDS

Gasoline and Diesel Fuel delivered at designated locations within the District in quantities as requested for one year beginning July 1, 2023 and ending June 30, 2024.

	Unleaded Fuel
	Morel Lemoine
	Gaubert Oil
	Lard Oil

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 1 Ravenswood
	.149
	.17
	.1995


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 2

Ravenswood
	.149
	.17
	.1995


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 3 

Maringouin
	.149
	.17
	.1995


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 4

Henderson
	.18
	.17
	.21


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 5 

Stephensville
	.75
	.17
	.21


Commissioner Kenneth Gordon moved, seconded by Commissioner Mark Guillory, and unanimously carried to take the fuel bids under advisement. 

                                                                     * * * * 
Mr. David Mougeot of Mougeot Architecture presented an update on rebuilding the boardroom.  Several options were presented. Total square footage is approximately 2,900 sq. ft. with additional storage on the second floor.  The construction bid will include work in the office area as well. After review, Commissioner Sean McGee moved, seconded by Commissioner Mark Guillory, and unanimously carried to accept Option #3. The commissioners discussed whether an additional sign needs to be included on the new building since we already have a sign.  It was concluded we will make that determination later.
                                                                     * * * * 
Commissioner Mark Guillory asked whether the per diem could be adjusted since some Commissioners have to travel much further to attend the board meetings. Mr. Tyson said the per diem is set by the legislature, and the last time it was changed was in 2015. He suggested the Commissioners introduce a local bill to increase the per diem for our area.  He asked each Commissioner to call their Senators to get their input and ask for their support. Mr. Tyson said this could also be handled if the law was changed to allow some commissioners to participate by phone or video.  
                                                                     * * * * 
A meeting of the Insurance/Finance Committee of the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District was held at 4:00 p.m., Wednesday, May 31, 2023, at the Board office in Port Allen, LA. Daniel Hebert called the meeting to order. 

The following members were present:

Daniel Hebert, Chairman 

Earl Matherne, 1st Vice Chairman

Karen Jewell, Member

Bill Flynn, Ex-Officio Chairman

John Grezaffi, Ex-Officio Chairman

Absent: 

None

Also Present:

Commissioner Kenneth Gordon

Commissioner Spencer Harvey

Commissioner Mark Guillory

Commissioner Tommy Thibodeaux

William Tyson, Executive Director

Kristy Jewell, Human Resource Analyst

Tiffany Weber, Administrative Program Specialist A

Crissi Canezaro, Administrative Program Specialist A

1. Amending the 2022-2023 Budget - Mr. Will Tyson presented a revised budget for 2022-2023 to keep the budget within 5% of our original projections. Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried to approve the revised version of the budget. The committee asked questions related to the solar panel project PILOT (Payment in Lieu of Taxes) and the Pointe Coupee protested taxes.  
2. Adopting the 2023-2024 Budget – The committee reviewed the proposed budget for 2023-2024. Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried to adopt the proposed 2023-2024 budget.

3. Discuss investments – Mr. William Tyson said he thinks we should ask our investment company to come to our next Finance Committee meeting to evaluate our investments.  Also at the next meeting, he recommended having our CPA come in and review our audit. The committee discussed the expenses which will be incurred with building the new board room.  Mr. Tyson said we are in the early stages and will know more after the blueprints are finalized.

There being no further business to come before the committee, upon motion by Commissioner Karen Jewell and unanimously carried, the meeting adjourned. 

Respectfully submitted,

/s/Daniel Hebert, Chairman


/s/Earl Matherne, 1st Vice Chairman

/s/Karen Jewell, Member


/s/Bill Flynn, Ex-Officio Chairman





/s/John Grezaffi, Ex-Officio Chairman

Commissioner Daniel Hebert advised the board that the meeting on May 31, 2023, was to adjust the current budget to keep it within 5% and to approve the proposed budget for next year.  Mr. Tyson reported some additional information that has been obtained on the 2023-2024 budget after the committee meeting which would include adding income for the Solar Farm (Pilot) in Pointe Coupee Parish of $43,000 for the year.  Commissioner Daniel Hebert moved, seconded by Commissioner Mark Guillory, and unanimously carried to approve the minutes of the Finance/Insurance Committee with the amendment noted to include the Solar Farm Pilot in Point Coupee Parish in the 2023-2024 budget. Mr. Tyson noted the cost of the construction to build the boardroom will be added by amendment when the final figures are finalized.
                                                                     * * * * 
Mr. William Tyson said a letter is going out by the Corps of Engineers relative to a Right of Entry to do Surveys on the East River Levee and the West River Levee. This is being done in accordance with the current law requiring notification of landowners when the Corps of Engineers plan to work on land owned by individuals.  
                                                                     * * * * 
Mr. Travis Johnson of CPRA had no report.

                                                                     * * * * 
Mr. Nicholas Rockforte said we are working with an attorney representing the individual who is claiming property near Belle River.  He said he has invited them to come and bring any documentation they have to show their chain of title.  

 * * * * 
Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Sean McGee, and unanimously carried to approve the detail and promotion following the detail of Mr. Gregory David from a Mobile Equipment Operator 2 to a Levee Foreman B.

Commissioner Jody Meche moved, seconded by Commissioner Sean McGee, and unanimously carried to approve the detail and promotion following the detail of Mr. Terry LeBlanc from a Mobile Equipment Operator 2 to a Mobile Equipment Operator 1/Heavy.

                                                                     * * * * 
There being no further business to come before the board, the board unanimously agreed to adjourn the meeting.   
____________________________________           ____________________________________

Janice Jarreau, Secretary


           John Grezaffi, President

____________________________________

Linda Alwood, Contract Stenographer 
An Equal Opportunity Employer

